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Farwell's: An Institution Remembered 
"Farwell's is an institution almost as 
much a part of 11/inois Chemistry as the 
immortal odor of Noyes laboratory. It 
is a restaurant across the street where 
at mid-morning staff and students 
gather for coffee and conversation and 
to relax and to discuss chemistry and 
football and sex atld last night's poker 
game and almost every other subject 
under the sun. Speed is almost always 
tl1ere and has been for tl1e thirty years 
or so that I have been going back to 11-
linois. 

"Farwell's is getting close to the other 
important matters I want to mention, 
the informality of Illinois and the 
building of lasting friendships between 
faculty and students and among the 
students themselves. It is close because 
the gatherings there are spontaneous 
and informal - nobody comes because 
Speed is there, or Bob Fuson. or Fred 
Wall, or anybody else. They all come 
because it is fun to come and that is all 
there is to it." 

Bill Lycan. Ph.D. 1929, in a 
professional address, 1955 

Since the little coffee shop on the cor­
ner of Mathews and California closed 
to university developers in 1971, 
nothing has quite taken its place in the 
affections of Illinois faculty or alumni, 
and few have forgotten Charlie, 
chemistry student turned shopkeeper, 
who set the scene for the social life in 
chemical sciences here for almost forty 
years. 

Charlie Huette (pronounced 'hitty') 
started working at Farwell's as a stu­
dent in 1934 when the business had 
already been going for ten years. He 
liked the place and the people, and, 
since money was scarce in the Depres­
sion, he stayed on, eventually dropped 

After prelims at Farwell's, 1951 

chemistry and married Ruth, the 
former Mrs. Farwell, in 1941. They 
rented out the shop between 1942 and 
1948, while Charlie was in service at 
Orange County Airport, Southern 
California, but, for the next 23 years, 
Farwell's and the chemistry crowd 
were his life. Charlie and Ruth worked 
long hours - he was 'up front' and she 
kept the show going in the back. How 
did he like the life? "Your feet get 
sore," Charlie says, but the customers 
were ''good guys," and, he adds, ''you 
can't get along with all the people all 
the time, but I got along with most." 

Students, faculty and the guys from 
the storeroom all passed through his 

door on a regular basis, carried ou t 35¢ 
quart bottles of beer in brown paper 
bags and sometimes watched the game 
or 'As The World Turns' on a little 
black and white TV. AI Saldeen recalls 
a time he drove back into town from a 
trip. It was three o'clock on the after­
noon of November 22, 1963, and the 
chemistry building was deserted . Presi­
dent Kennedy had been assassinated 
and everyone was at Farwell's watch­
ing the only TV in the area. Saldeen 
remembers the place with great affec­
tion, except for the plastic coffee cups, 
which got so stained that they would 

continued on page 2 



Marvel, Smith, Curtin and others - coffee at Farwell's Charlie, "The Fanvell" 

be soaked over the weekend in bleach 
- "on Monday morning, you thought 
you were drinking Clorox." 

Charlie, now a robust 76, has forgot­
ten little about his former patrons, 
their opinions, their humor or the way 
they liked their eggs. People like 'Dad­
dy' Noyes - "a small man, who drank 
lemon cokes, as I recall," and Dr. 
Bailar, Huette's former instructor, who 
would come to the beer bashes after 
prelims and have a butter-pecan ice­
cream cone. Charlie remembers Speed 
Marvel, with his photographic 
memory, reciting passages of Virgil 
remembered from high school. Speed 
was a man who "never curbed his use 
of words." As for gentlemen. Charlie 
talks often of Sherlock Swann (have 
you got another hour? he wants to 
know). "Sherlock was different. .. he 
used to call me Charles, in that 
Baltimore accent." A very intense man. 
who was "made to be a bachelor," 
Swann would eat breakfast with 
Charlie most days - "orange juice, 
puffed rice with half and half, and cof­
fee - you could set the clock by him." 

A collection of mementos at Huette's 
house includes even the flyers that 
made the rounds of the coffee tables in 
the early '70s - 'Strike Against U.S. 
Involvement in Cambodia' and 'Bury 
Nixon in Mail.' Charlie recalls the time 
Dr. Gutowsky tried appeasing student 
rioters from a fire escape on the east 
side of the Chemistry Annex, and the 

recruiter from Dow Chemical Com­
pany who came in for a coffee while 
students outside were protesting Dow's 
part in the manufacture of napalm for 
Vietnam. 

By the late 1960s, Farwell's was en­
tirely surrounded by university proper­
ty, but. in spite of an offer from 
McDonalds in 1968, the shop con­
tinued to hold out, and survived on 
trade from chemistry. biology cmd 
music. Someone else who had been in­
terested in Farwell's was a journalism 
student who approached Charlie 
sometime in 1950 about setting up in 
the back room to edit an on-campus 
magazine. Charlie and Ruth were con­
cerned about partitioning the shop and 
about ''all-night sessions" and so they 
turned him down. The student's name 
was Hugh Heffner. 

By 1971, the shop had become 'emi­
nent domain' for the university. Ruth 
and Charlie were not far from retiring 
age, and didn't contest the inevitable 
- "that only benefits the lawyers 
anyway." 

Mr. Huette now lives in west Cham­
paign. He cultivates amaryllis and says 
that one of these days he'd like to do 
some travelling. 
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Distinguished Staff Award 
to AI Saldeen 
Mr. John A. Saldeen, electronics 
engineer and supervisor of the SCS 
Electronic Shop and Photographic 
Facility, was the winner of a 1986 
Distinguished Nonacademic Staff 
Award this spring from the university's 
chancellor, Thomas Everhart. 

Saldeen was one of eight staff 
members on campus who were 
honored with a plaque of appreciation, 
a $200 award and a recognition dinner 
in April. 

"AI" Saldeen joined the chemistry 
staff in 1960 as electronics technician 
and has managed the Electronics Con­
struction and Repair Shop and 
Photographic Service since 1970. 
Supervising a facility which processes 
over 2000 work requests a year (in­
cluding more than 15,000 slides for in­
struction and 12.000 prints for publica­
tion) is a role of critical importance to 
both faculty and students in the school. 
The shop and its services have become 
indispensible to some of the best 
chemical sciences research programs in 
the world. 

It is his genuine involvement and a 
real commitment to the school that 
have endeared AI Saldeen to faculty 
and peers. He has given his $200 award 
to the Flygare Memorial Fund. 



The Faculty __________ _ 
Gregorio Weber Wins 
Biochemistry Award 

Professor Gregorio Weber. 
w/10 retires this year 

Gregorio Weber, professor of 
biochemistry, has been selected as the 
first recipient of the 1986 Repligen 
Award for the Chemistry of Biological 
Processes - a new award administered 
by the Biological Chemistry Division 
of the American Chemical Society. The 
award recognized Dr. Weber's "out­
standing contributions to the under­
standing of the chemistry of biological 
processes, with particular emphasis on 
structure, function and mechanism." 

The Repligen Award is sponsored by 
the Repligen Corporation of Cam­
bridge, Massachusetts, and carries a 
silver medal and a $3,000 honorarium. 
It was presented to Dr. Weber at the 
joint meeting of the ACS Division of 
Biological Chemistry and the Ameri­
can Society of Biological Chemists in 
Washington, D. C., this June. Weber's 
award lecture was entitled "Use of 
High Pressure in the Study of 
Macromolecules." 

A two-day symposium and banquet 
were held in Urbana this June to honor 
Professor Weber on the occasion of his 
retirement from teaching at the univer­
sity. Dr. Weber received his M.D. 
from Buenos Aires University in 1943 
and his Ph.D. from Cambridge Univer­
sity in 1947. His research interests have 
centered on biochemistry and biophy­
sical chemistry, most recently on 
ultraviolet absorption and fluorescence 
emission of light by proteins. 

.(/The Last One Left to Get"-------... 
Speed Marvel receives National Medal of Science 

At 91, Carl Marvel, emeritus professor 
of lllinois and one of the century's 
great organic chemists, says his Na­
tional Medal of Science is "a very nice 
honor." When the award was an­
nounced in February, Marvel told 
reporters, "it's about the last one left to 
get," but added, "it's also the highest 
one I've received." 

Professor Marvel accepted the 
award (the nation's highest recognition 
for achievement in engineering or 
science) from President Reagan during 
ceremonies at the White House on 
March 12. He is one of about 185 scien­
tists who have received the medal (and 
certificate signed by the president) 
since it was first presented in 1962. 

Carl 'Speed' Marvel joined the facul­
ty at the University of Arizona after a 
46-year career at Illinois. His research 
here in the 1930s led to the creation of 
polybenzimidazole, used in synthetic 
rubber and in the flame-repellent suits 
worn by astronauts. 

Professor Marvel still works at 
Arizona and has maintained a close 
consulting relationship with Out Pont 
since 1928. Today, in collaboration 
with the U.S. Army and Air Force, he 
is conducting research on heat-stable 

Scott Wins Sloan 
Fellowship 
Robert Scott, assistant professor of 
chemistry, has been awarded a Sloan 
Fellowship, worth $25,000, for out­
standing promise in his research field. 

The awards are made every year to 
90 young scientists nationwide 
(selected from 450 nominations) to 
provide stimulus at a critical stage in 
the development of independent 
research projects. Sloan fellows are 
permitted to use the funds in a wide 
variety of ways, affording great flex­
ibility to pursue original work. 

Dr. Scott's research into biological 
electron transfer reactions aims to 
understand the mechanisms employed 
by living systems and to create syn­
thetic means of storing energy. 
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polymers in order to develop a lighter­
weight material that could be used to 
replace metal in airplane wings. 

Only three other SCS faculty have 
received the medal; they are Roger 
Adams, William Rose and Herbert 
Gutowsky. 

Y ankwich Elected to 
ACS Board 
Peter E. Yankwich, professor of 
chemistry, has been elected to the 
American Chemical Society's board of 
directors to serve a three-year term 
beginning January 1, 1986. Professor 
Yankwich is on loan this year to the 
National Science Foundation as pro­
gram executive of the Directorate of 
Science and Engineering Education. 

Yankwich joined the faculty at Il­
linois in 1948 and has been a member 
of the ACS since 1945. He has served 
on numerous ACS committees, and is 
past chairman of the Division of 
Physical Chemistry. Dr. Yankwich 
was director-at-large of the ACS from 
1982-1984. 



A Chemical Look at Biology 

Electron paths in proteins 1 

Chemical reactions govern all aspects 
of biological processes, from enzyme 
catalysis to transfer of charge, matter 
and information. According to chemis­
try professor Peter Wolynes, any deep 
understanding of biological reactions 
must be based on a sound theory of 
chemical reaction dynamics. As part of 
their research program, he and his 
group at Illinois, in collaboration with 
professor of physics and chemistry, 
Hans Frauenfelder and postdoctoral re­
searcher Atsuo Kuki, are using their 
knowledge of chemical reaction theory 
as a basis to understand biology. 

Until now, Wolynes explains, most 
of the knowledge of reaction dynamics 
has come from studies of two-body in­
teractions of small molecules in the gas 
phase - a very simple system. Bio­
molecules, by contrast, provide a com­
plex and highly organized environment 
that can profoundly affect the course 
of the reaction. It is this complexity 
which provides such a rich field for 
study of the fundamental aspects of 
reaction dynamics. 

In a recent paper which appeared in 
Science magazine, Wolynes and 
Frauenfelder say they based their ideas 
on the premise that kinetic control is at 
the heart of many biological processes 
and that an assessment of the relative 
importance of nuclear and electronic 
motions is desirable. They showed that 
the binding of dioxygen (02) and car­
bon monoxide (CO) to heme proteins 
is a situation where the problem can be 
studied in detail. Their investigation of 
these reactions is aimed at constructing 
a qualitative framework for under-

standing the general issue of nuclear 
and electronic motions in biomolecular 
reactions. 

Wolynes' research has found that 
friction and steric effects which change 
nuclear motions may play a far more 
important role in proteins than in 
simpler systems. He believes that, if 
successful, the study of biomolecules 
will teach us much more about reaction 
theory in general. It is a knowledge 
which may also be applied to other 
systems and reactions, and which 
could eventually help clarify biological 
functions such as photosynthesis 1 in 
plants and energy conversion in 
animals. 

Using the supercomputer at the Uni­
versity of Illinois, Wolynes and Kuki 
have looked at the other aspect of the 
reaction problem, by modeling elec­
tron motion in proteins, an important 
step in many life processes. The super­
computer calculates possible paths of 
electrons within a protein molecule 
(more than one path is involved be­
cause of the uncertainty principle in 
physics). "In this way," Wolynes says, 
"we visualize which parts of th~ in­
tervening medium are important in the 
electron transfer process." 

Professor Wolynes has been selected 
to receive a 1986 Guggenheim Fellow­
ship for his work in disorder physics 
and the chemistry of liquids and 
biomolecules. Guggenheim fellows are 
chosen for "unusually distinguished 
achievement in the past and excep­
tional promise for future accomplish­
ment," the foundation said. 
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Three SCS Faculty Named 
'University Scholars' 
Jiri Jonas, Gary Schuster and Peter 
Wolynes, professors of chemistry, 
were among the first recipients of the 
University Scholars prize, a campus 
award given last year for the first time 
at the University of Illinois. 

The program is designed to identify 
outstanding members of the faculty 
and to provide them with annual funds 
for discretionary use rather than for a 
specific project. As such, the awards 
are a recognition or individual ex­
cellence and are made through nomina­
tions, not by application. 

As 'Senior University Scholars,· pro­
fessors Jonas and Schuster were cited 
as being 'among the very best in their 
fields' and were awarded $10,000 per 
year on a 3-year basis, for 'clearly 
superior' work. 

The 'University Scholar' prize which 
awarded $5,000 to Dr. Wolynes is de­
signed to recognize younger faculty 
members "who show great promise." 

1986 Rose Award to 
Gunsalus 
l.C. Gunsalus, professor emeritus of 
biochemistry, was this year's recipient 
of the William C. Rose Award in Bio­
chemistry and Nutrition which recog­
nizes distinguished scholars who have 
made outstanding contributions to 
these fields. 

Professor Gunsalus has won interna­
tional recognition for his work on the 
mechanisms of chemical and energy 
transfer reactions in microorganisms 
and on the genetics and transfer of 
plasmids. His lecture, given on May 2, 
was entitled "Oxygen An Essential 
Danger, The P450CAM Model." 

The lectureship was held this year in 
Urbana and honored the memory of 
Professor William Rose, emeritus pro­
fessor of biochemistry at Illinois, who 
died last year. The fund was establish­
ed in 1977, on the occasion of Pro­
fessor Rose's 90th birthday, by former 
students, friends and colleagues to 
honor the pioneering biochemist who 
discovered threonine, the last major 
amino acid to be identified. 



Coming Back. . . An Interview with David Paisley 

Visiting professor of chemistry, David Paisley, expresses 
some thoughts on returning to Illinois to teach after 25 
years in industry 

David M. Paisley, Ph.D. 1961 (organic 
chemistry). has joined the School of 
Chemical Sciences as a visiting pro­
fessor of chemistry after a 25-year 
career in the pharmaceutical industry 
and on Wall Street. Dr. Paisley has 
long been regarded as a leading analyst 
of the drug industry and, for 12 con­
secutive years, was named to Institu­
tional Investor's "All American Team" 
of security analysts. For a decade, as a 
vice president of Merrill Lynch and 
Co., Paisley headed the group respon­
sible for the firm 's investment analyses 
of pharmaceutical and biotechnology 
companies and helped initiate Merrill 
Lynch's coverage of the Japanese phar­
maceutical industry. 

"Contemporary New-Drug Science" 
is the title of the new special topics 
course which Paisley suggested, 
designed and taught last semester as 
Chemistry 391. Dr. Paisley says: 

"After speaking with Larry Faulk­
ner, I somehow conceived of the course 
as a 'chatty tutorial ' for perhaps a 
dozen students. I envisioned sitting 
around a table discussing quaint papers 
from the medical literature and affec­
ting a pipe and tweeds. It was a shock 
to learn that instead of a dozen. 121 
students had registered. Either there is 
great interest in new drugs, or word of 
a 'gut course' travels fast. 

"Many professionals of my age are 
rethinking what they want to do with 
the next 15 years. This is 'burnout 
time.' I found that the pressures of 
Wall Street, including more than 100 
days of travel a year, had become a 
real pounding, and there was also a 
sense of "deja vu" - of having been 
everywhere twice and done everything 
once. 

"My children are all away at school; 
I'm 50 and a new grandfather - it 
seemed like an ideal time for a repot­
ting. I had been wonderfully happy at 
Illinois as a graduate student with 
Speed Marvel. I kept in touch with the 

David Paisley 

university, and followed the teams, 
and I have many friends in Cham­
paign-Urbana. I've watched the cam­
pus mood become more and more 
upbeat. Illinois is definitely on a roll -
you see signs of that everywhere, from 
the high national departmental rank­
ings throughout the university, to the 
supercomputer, to the successful cam­
paign for lllinois, to the fine football 
and basketball teams that have 
galvanized alumni. Spending three 
days a week here teaching a new course 
sounded like a perfect change of pace, 
·and I thought my unusual perspective 
might be valuable to SCS students." 

In the fall semester, Paisley will con­
duct a seminar course designed to "ex­
plore the interface of business and 
science" - another new offering. 

After leaving Merrill Lynch last 
year, Dr. Paisley established an active 
consulting practice with several drug 
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and biotechnology companies. He also 
retains a major association with Merrill 
Lynch's Securities Research and Invest­
ment Banking Divisions and continues 
to publish reports on the drug in­
dustry. 

"Umbilicals to Wall Street and the 
pharmaceutical industry are still at­
tached, and my professional interest is 
as great as ever. But I can't say that I've 
ever done anything quite as much fun 
as teaching at Illinois. I spoke with Dr. 
Bailar the other day and he told me 
how much he had always enjoyed lec­
turing - 'I just loved it, ' he said. Of 
course, he speaks from enormous suc­
cess and experience, but I know the 
feeling. I'm so impressed with my 
students. They're smart, savvy, in­
terested and very courteous - really 
good kids. But I think they've made it 
clear that they're eager for news of the 
outside world, and jiri Jonas and Larry 
Faulkner recognize that. 

"By the way, there must be a foun­
tain of youth in the Chemistry Depart­
ment - everyone looks, talks, and 
comports himself exactly as he did 25 
years ago. It's amazing how little the 
people and the ambience have chang­
ed . Sitting at morning coffee with im­
mortals of Illinois chemistry is like be­
ing caught in a time warp. 

"Oddly, it wasn't unusual for 
members of my class to have careers 
somewhat off the beaten track. Just to 
mention a few of my friends: Bill Ad­
cock coordinates Shell Chemical's en­
vironmental legal forces, John Witt 
scaled up aspartame.for G.D. Searle, 
and jack Kampmeier is in the Dean's 
role at the University of Rochester. 
Perhaps the experiment of my appoint­
ment will catch the attention of other 
Illinois chemists with a unique perspec­
tive that they might consider sharing 
with our students in seminars, or even 
on a sabbatical-of-sorts. I can assure 
them that the experience of returning 
to Illinois is, well, awesome." 



Profile-Professor Nelson J. Leonard 

Professor Nelson J, Leonard's retire­
ment later this year might occa­

sion some pomp and circumstance in 
the School of Chemical Sciences, but it 
won't make much difference in the 
Leonard labs. The 'retirement' is, as his 
friend Herb Carter comments, "a se­
mantic word for slightly modified acti­
vities." After a 44-year career at the 
University of Illinois, Nelson Leonard 
has directed 120 graduate students and 
80 postdocs and published 400 papers. 
The research, he says, is "going so 
well, I can't stop now.'' 

Internationally acclaimed for his 
tafent as an organic chemist, specifical­
ly for his skill in synthesizing mole­
cules, Dr. Leonard has evidenced a 
tremendous breadth of approach in his 
work which, over the years, has 
answered questions of fundamental im­
portance in biochemistry and life pro­
cesses. 

In organic chemistry, Leonard is 
known for the invention of new func­
tionality by means of transannular 
reactions across medium rings and for 
the elucidation of the interactions that 
play an important role in intramolec­
ular and intermolecular associations 
and transformations. He has also been 
responsible for the addition of new 
families of reactions, including those 
based on the iminium group, a fast­
reacting, ionic carbonyl-equivalent. 
Applications of his work to biochemis­
try have included the fluorescent 
derivatization of nucleosides, 
nudeotides, and coenzymes, the con­
cept of dimensional probes of enzyme­
coenzyme active sites, and the con­
struction of covalent DNA-RNA 
double-helical cross-sections. In the 
field of plant biology, Leonard has 
isolated, identified and synthesized 
cytokinins - plant hormones that 
bring about cell-division, cell-growth 
and differentiation - and he has 
supervised the synthesis and binding to 
plant tissue of photoaffinity-labeling 
auxins - plant hormones for cell 
elongation and root growth. These two 
classes of plant hormones are basic to 
the magnification and modification of 
plasmid production which together 
hold the key to genetic engineering ap­
plications in plant tissue culture. 

"Tire retirement of Nelson ]. Leonard 
marks the ending of that golden age of 
organic chemistry at the University of 
lllinois which is associated with Roger 
Adams, C.S. Marvel, R.C. Fuson, and 
H.R. Snyder. Nelson has been a wor­
thy successor to Adams in his leader­
s /tip role for chemistry at the Universi­
ty of Illinois and for "Organic Syn­
theses.'' It is important that Nelson is 
not retiring from science because one 
of the extraordinary tl1ings about him 
is the way in which l1e continues to 
grow, to expand his areas of interest, 
to make highly significant contribu­
tions to basic organic chemistry, bio­
chemistry and molecular biology. At 
an age when many hav e laid down the 
gauntlet, Nelson is making new 
discoveries with seeming ease, and yet 
with meticulous care and attention to 
detail. 

.. . I have been impressed particular­
ly by his progression from organic syn­
theses and alkaloid chemistry to 
studies of kinases (with his 'stretched 
substrates '; whoever suspected they 
would work so well?), plant growth 
hormones, biotin-avadin complexes, 
fluorescent lifetime studies of NAbH 
and photoaffinity labeling. 

Nelson is a great chemist (albeit a 
too modest one), a great person and 
richly deserving of the appreciation 
and affection of his many friends and 
colleagues. ·· 

Jack Roberts, Professor of Chemistry, 
California Institute of Technology. 

Leonard's early fascination for chem­
istry was derived from the "explo­

sions, stinks, fire and color" that he 
concocted on the kitchen stove with a 
boys' chemical set. Looking back, he 
says, "My mother was very tolerant.'' 
They lived in Mount Vernon, New 
York, where Leonard went to high 
school. His father, who had had to 
leave school to work at the age of four­
teen, was in the retail trade and com­
muted to New York City until he was 
72. Leonard recalls, "His major bit of 
advice to me was 'don't commute'." 
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At age 8, Nelson took up an interest 
which was to match his love for chem­
istry and rival his academic career for 
more than 30 years - he began singing 
in a Mount Vernon boys' choir. The 
choirmaster, a man from Sheffield, 
England, claimed he could teach any 
boy to sing in spite of Mrs. Leonard's 
comment "not this one - he can't 
carry a tune.'' He learned to, and 
became a solo performer at the age of 
ten. In later years, Leonard was a 
soloist of the Lehigh University Glee 
Club while an undergraduate, soloist 
of the Lincoln Chapel Choir in Oxford, 
and secretary of the Oxford Opera 
Club, while a Rhodes Scholar, and 
sometime bass soloist of the Calvary 
Episcopal Church, New York, while 
pursuing graduate studies at Columbia 
University. He studied voice extensive­
ly in England and America, and, dur­
ing his first 10 years on the faculty at Il­
linois, he did recital and oratorio work 
throughout the Midwest. 

Leonard's early singing helped pay 
for tuition at Lehigh University where 
he won a Rhodes scholarship to Ox­
ford in 1937. His father, who thought 
that after a college degree it was time 
for his son to go to work, had to be 
pursuaded that this was an offer not to 
refuse. After his studies at Oxford were 
curtailed by the war in Europe, 
Leonard returned to take his Ph.D. at 
Columbia University. After nine years 



of co!Jege life and a Ph.D. degree in 
1942, Nelson's father finally asked him 
"Now are you going to work?" 

Chemistry did eventually start to 
earn him some money - the princely 
sum of $2,000 a year as a research 
assistant for Roger Adams at Illinois. 
He was even able to send money home. 
At the same time, Leonard's singing 
career flourished. Solo appearances 
with the Chicago, Cleveland, and St. 
Louis Symphony Orchestras, in Bach 
festivals, at other universities, and 
with many different choruses were in­
terspersed with recitals at the Universi­
ty of Illinois. 

An offer of becoming a Professor of 
Voice at another major university 
jolted Leonard into making a clear 
career choice. The offer came at about 
the time of his election to the National 
Academy of Sciences and Leonard felt 
that, if his peers had chosen to recog­
nize him as a chemist, then he had "bet­
ter do something about it.'' He realized 
that there was more scope for originali­
ty in full-time devotion to chemistry 
and a more lasting contribution 
through the literature of science. 
Besides, to make any kind of living 
through singing, he would have had to 
go into opera - "a bit late to make 
such an attempt," he says. The family 
joke is that he made the decision bet­
ween chemistry and music the day that 
the honorarium from a chemistry lec­
ture equalled that he made singing. At 
any rate, there were no doubts after 
1955, and the heavy professional 
demands of chemistry meant that there 
were no more singing performances. 

Leonard's research: 
'spans an impressive range of lletero­

cyclic chemistry, of molecular rear­
rangements, and of contributions to 
the organic chemistry of nitrogen. In 
first class research extmding over one 
third of a century, {he/ lias woven a 
strong and durable part of the fabric of 
modern organic chemistry.·· 

University of Illinois colleague. 

D r. Leonard's academic career was 
one which, as he puts it "stum­

bled all the way along.'' He started off 
in college taking courses in chemical 
engineering because he had two uncles 
who were engineers and engineering 
seemed most like a 'career.' It was only 
when, on the dean's advice, he shifted 

Nelson Leonard with Roger Adams 

to chemistry and so could apply for a 
Rhodes Scholarship, that he realized 
chemistry might actually be a profes­
sion as well as fun. Taking chemistry 
as a major meant he could also finish 
his senior year by taking enjoyable 
courses in English, History and [nter­
national Politics. 

At Oxford, Leonard did research in 
physical chemistry on inorganic and 
organic compounds of nitrogen with 
Professor Neville Vincent Sidgwick 
and Dr. Leslie Sutton. He found he was 
not suited to the physical chemistry 
part - "not smart enough to design 
apparatus" - but he liked to ma~e 
compounds. Much later, during a Gug­
genheim sabbatical in Switzerland in 
1960, Leonard again shifted his area of 
interest from organic chemistry toward 
biochemistry and became an innovator 
in the new area of bio-organic 
chemistry. 

Dr. Leonard's many professional 
honors include membership in the Na­
tional Academy of Sciences, fellowship 
in the American Academy of Arts and 
Sciences, foreign membership in the 
Polish Academy of Sciences, the 
American Chemical Society Award for 
Creative Work in Synthetic Organic 
Chemistry (1963), the Medal for 
Creative Research in Synthetic Organic 
Chemistry of the Synthetic Organic 
Chemical Manufacturers' Association 
{1970), and the Roger Adams Award in 
Organic Chemistry {1981). Leonard also 
has an honorary Sc.D. from Lehigh, a 
D.Sc. from Oxford University and is 
Doctor Hon. Causa, Adam Mickiewicz 
University, Poland. Best of all was the 
Roger Adams Award in 1981 and the 
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feeling, Leonard says, of "living up to 
Adams." He felt that a huge inherited 
load had been taken off his shoulders -
"I think he might even have approved." 

Adams and Leonard got along 
famously although, Leonard says, 
Adams would never compliment him, 
though he apparently spoke well of 
him to others. Dr. Leonard recalls that 
when he was "young and 
obstreperous," he used to get annoyed 
with people in the office or storeroom 
for not ordering equipment or chemi­
cals on time - he once climbed over 
the transom to change the priority of 
orders and get something faster. 
Adams' advke was to "come and 
pound on my desk - not anyone 
else's." 

Dr. Leonard's long-standing involve­
ment with Organic Syntheses has con­
tinued an Illinois/ Adams tradition (the 
annual volumes were started by 
Adams after World War I) and reflects 
his intense loyalty to the department 
and the university. Now in its 64th 
volume, the journal publishes the 
results of preparations checked by 
eight editors around the world, and 
maintains investments that originated 
from the royalties of sales of the 
volumes of Organic Syntheses. 
Leonard was editor from 1951 to 1958, 
and has been on the Board of Directors 
since 1969 and its president since 1980. 
Over the past 5 to 6 years. investments 
have tripled in value, so that Organic 
Syntheses is able to perform a generous 
role in the support of organic chemis­
try in the United States. Professor 
Leonard's membership on the Selection 
Committee of the John Simon Gug-



genheim Foundation since 1977 has 
also involved a great amount of time 
and effort, but is a tremendously im­
portant service to the academic com­
munity at large. A colleague at Illinois 
says that Nelson has always been ab­
solutely committed to seeing that other 
chemists, particularly younger ones, 
receive due recognition within the 
chemical community. 

On the lessons learned from Nelson 
Leonard: 
"Among these I include the distinction 
between science and tlte best science . .. 
I have tried to follow Nelson's example 
in training my own students through 
teaching by personal example, en­
couraging professionalism and 
tolerating a diversity of individual 
styles." 

Sidney M. Hecht, former Leonard stu­
dent, who now holds joint appoint­
ments as Professor of Chemistry and 
Biology at the University of Virginia 
and as Vice President of Chemical 
Research and Development at Smith 
Kline and French Laboratories. 

"With Nelson, I learned to appreciate 
the difference between effort and com­
mitmerrt - my work was a commit­
ment; I gave it everything f had, and 
Nelson has a lot to do with that." 

George Barrio, former Leonard stu­
dent, and now Professor and Head of 
Chemistry in the Division of Nuclear 
Medicine at the University of Califor­
nia, Los Angeles. 

Leonard's interest in the careers of 
his own graduates has formed lasting 
student-professor relationships 
throughout his teaching career. In 
March, April and May of this year, the 
Nelson J. Leonard Seminar Series was 
held to honor Dr. Leonard's retire­
ment. Seven former students gave tech­
nical presentations and all credited 
their former professor with enormous 
influence at the start of their careers in 
industry or academia. The seven were 
Dr. Seemon Pines, of Merck, Professor 
Donald E. Bergstrom, University of 
North Dakota, Professor Michinori 
Oki, University of Tokyo, Professor 
David F. Wiemer, University of Iowa, 
Professor Sidney M. Hecht. University 
of Virginia, Professor A.}. Kresge, 

University of Toronto, and Professor 
Carl R. Johnson, Wayne State Univer­
sity. The eighth and final lecture in the 
series was given by Professor Stanley 
Cristo! of the University of Colorado, 
an early postdoc of Roger Adams. 

George Barrio, a Doctor of Biochem­
istry from Argentina, did postdoctoral 
work with Professor Leonard during 
the period 1970-72 and worked with 
him again in 1975 and 1976, picking up 
a Ph.D. in chemistry from the Univer­
sity of Illinois almost by acclaim. 
Knowing of Leonard by reputation, 
Barrio says it was a tremendous honor 
to come to work for him, and, in 
retrospect, "an absolutely unbelievable 
opportunity." The reception Leonard 
gave him and his family when they first 
arrived in the U.S. was a show of 
humanity Barrio will never ·forget. He 
says the support Nelson has always 
given his students is "emotional as well 
as technical." 

"Nelson 's contributions as a role model 
and a friend to younger faculty 
members did much to maintain the 
sta11dards and the atmosphere of oLtr 
Department necessary to keep it in the 
top group of Chemistry Departments 
in the country." 

J.C. Martin. Professor of Chemistry, 
Vanderbilt University, and Emeritus 
Professor at lllinois. 1 

As a teacher, Nelson is a natural. To 
him, teaching is "a magic thing," a 
"young-keeping experience" which has 
thrust him into instant friendships with 
young people from all over the world. 
He appreciates especially the excite­
ment of watching undergraduates, 
observing again and again how they 
catch on to the interrelationships of 
science and, with graduate students in 
the final doctoral year, how ''the stu­
dent's mind rushes on ahead of the pro­
fessor's and the experiments suggested 
to be performed next month were ac­
tually completed yesterday." 

At 69, Dr. Leonard travels as 
voraciously as ever. He and his 

wife have always loved traveling 
together its "romantic" and 
"enlivening" Leonard says. Until 1968, 
they took separate transportation on 
account of their four children. Then in 
Israel once, they were confronted with 
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the problem of taking a DC 3 airplane 
that was so ancient and dilapidated 
that Nell decided if it had been kept 
together this long, it must be safe. 
They visit Holland, Nell's home, at 
least once a year and still have many 
friends in England. Of their four 
children, two now live in Seattle, one 
in Los Angeles, and one in New York, 
and the family maintains a ski lodge in 
Snowmass Village, Colorado, and a 
summer cottage near Manistee, 
Michigan. 

" ... you're not the retiring sort 
When it comes to hard work ar1d 
sport. " 

Leonard children, from a poem on the 
occasion of his retirement 

The ski lodge is well loved among 
chemistry colleagues, many of whom 
have attended the 'Aspenyl Conference 
in Chemistry and Biochemistry,' held 
every year during Spring Break. 
Visitors (up to four couples in addition 
to the Leonards) ski during the day, 
finishing at about 4 o'clock, and attend 
a seminar - given by each chemist in 
turn - in the evening. Dr. Robert 
Coates, professor of chemistry at Il­
linois, says it's an opportunity for pro­
fessional interaction amongst senior 
chemists which is not often afforded 
during term-time when communica­
tions tend to be limited to the ad­
ministrative and social. The Aspenyl 
Conference also allows Dr. Leonard to 
maintain long-standing friendships 
with chemistry skiing colleagues such 
as Jack Roberts, from UCLA, David 
Kearns, from the University of Califor­
nia, San Diego, and Jiri and Ana Jonas, 
from the University of Illinois. 

Relinquishing his teaching respon­
sibilities will give Dr. Leonard "a little 
more time" to spend in Colorado and 
Michigan. which he'll enjoy. As for 
retirement. Professor Leonard doesn't 
talk about it much. Barrio says the two 
things he never would talk about were 
retirement and his birthday. Current 
research grants will last another two or 
three years, and he will continue to 
direct a group of five or six postdocs. 
In addition, the rest of life continues 
apace. Two of Leonard's skiing col­
leagues have asked him (although he 
has "some question as to their 
motives") to join them in a ski-racing 
camp in California next January. He 
says he's considering it. 



The Alumni 
Volwiler in Hall of Fame 

Ernest H . Volwiler, Ph.D. 1918, was 
one of five inventors named to the Na­
tional Inventors' Hall of Fame in Arl­
ington, Virginia, in February. 

Dr. Volwiler, 92, retired chairman of 
the board of Abbott Laboratories, was 
Roger Adams' first Ph.D. student. His 
place in the National Inventors' Hall of 
Fame, along with co-inventor, Dr. 
Donalee L. Tabern, honors their 
discovery of Pentothal, a barbiturate 
compound that rapidly and smoothly 
induces anesthesia for major and minor 
surgery. More than 50 years after its 
development, Pentothal is still the 
most widely used induction anesthetic 
in the world. 

Dr. Volwiler joined Abbott Labora­
tories as a research chemist after 
graduating from Ulinois in 1918. His 
collaboration with Dr. Tabern resulted 
in the production of sedative and 
anesthetic compounds which con­
tributed significantly to better medical 
and surgical treatment worldwide. 
Volwiler became chairman of the 
board of Abbott Laboratories in 1958. 
He retired in 1959. 

Volwller joins an august company in 
the National Hall of Fame. Fellow in­
ventors inducted this year were co­
inventor Tabern (deceased), plant 
breeder luther Burbank (posthumous­
ly). Harold Egerton, for electronic 
flash equipment for photography, and 
Wilson Greatbatch, for the medical 
cardiac pacemaker. Earlier inventors 
honored include Thomas Edison, Alex­
ander Graham Bell, Orville and Wilbur 
Wright and Henry Ford. 

Alumni News ____ _ 
1931 
Tsi-Yu Kao, Ph.D. 1931 (organic 
chemistry), is a chemistry professor at 
Nanjing University. Nanjing, China. 

1933 
Arthur G. Holstein, B.S. 1933 
(chemistry), has been awarded the first 
Melville L. Wolfram award, given by 
the carbohydrate division of the 
American Chemical Society. Holstein, 
retired chairman of Pfanstiehl Labora­
tories Inc., of Waukegan, Illinois, was 
honored for "distinguished service to 
the division and to the field of car­
bohydrate chemistry." Holstein lives in 
Beaufort, South Carolina. 

1935 
Glen Tilbury, M.S. 1935 (chemistry). 
professor emeritus of the University of 
Wisconsin-Platteville, has completed 
the fourth edition of his book, "Prob­
lem-Solving in Chemistry" (Houghton­
Mifflin, 1985}. Professor Tilbury 
recently received a Phi Delta Kappa 
Award for outstanding service to 
education. 1 

1938 
William B. Katz, B.S. 1938 (chemical 
engineering), has been named a fellow 
of the American Institute of Chemical 
Engineers, which cited him for outstan­
ding contributions to the prevention 
and clean-up of oil and hazardous 
material spills. Katz is president of the 
Illinois Chemical Corporation in High­
land Park, lllinois. 

Glenn C. Finger, Ph.D. 1938 
(chemistry}, has been voted an 
honorary member of the lllinois State 
Academy of Science. A retired chemist 
of the Illinois Geological Survey, 
Finger made discoveries in aromatic 
fluorine chemistry which provided a 
basis for advancements in agriculture, 

9 

toxicology, microbiology, and 
theoretical chemistry. Dr. Finger lives 
in Urbana. 

1941 
Eugene L Ringwald, B.S. 1941 
(chemistry). recently retired from 
Monsanto after 40 years and joined the 
International Executive Service Corps . 
On a recent posting, he was a technical 
advisor in Taiwan in the area of 
polyester fibers. Ringwald's home is in 
Raleigh, North Carolina. 

William J. Shannon, Ph.D. 1941 
(chemistry). was among 16 food scien­
tists and food technologists inducted as 
fellows of the Institute of Food 
Technologists at its annual meeting last 
year. Shannon is president of Shannon 
Consulting Co., Northbrook, lllinois. 

1944 
Rudolph R. Deanin, Ph.D. 1944 
(organic chemistry), founded and 
directs the graduate programs in 
plastics at the University of Lowell, 
Massachusetts. Deanin received the 
Society of Plastics Engineers 1985 
Award for Outstanding Achievements 
in Education. He is the author of seven 
books, 190 papers and 36 patents on 
polymers and plastics. 

1945 
Paul V. Smith, Ph.D. 1945 
(chemistry ), has been re-elected chair­
man of the board of directors of the 
American Chemical Society. Smith is 
manager of education and professional 
society relations at Exxon Research and 
Engineering Co., Annandale, New 
Jersey. 

Kuan Hsu Chen, Ph.D. 1945 (organic 
chemistry). is a professor of chemistry 
at Peking Normal University in China. 
His research is in the area of organic 
synthesis. 



1947 
Henry F. Holtzclaw, Ph.D. 194 7 
(chemistry), is dean of Graduate 
Studies at the University of Nebraska, 
Lincoln, Nebraska. 

Robert L. Myers, Ph.D. 1947 (organic 
chemistry), has been named vice presi­
dent of technology by Champion Inter­
national Corp., Stamford, Connec­
ticut. Myers is a fellow of the Technical 
Association of the Pulp and Paper In­
dustry and a trustee of St. Thomas 
Aquinas College. 

R. Byron Bird, B.S. 1947 (chemical 
engineering) (Ph.D. 1950, University 
of Wisconsin), is Vilas Professor and 
MacArthur Professor at the University 
of Wisconsin. Professor Bird holds 
honorary doctorates from Lehigh Uni­
versity, Washington University, Clark­
son University and the Technische 
Hogeschool Delft, The Netherlands. 
He was recently elected a foreign 
member of the Royal Netherlands 
Academy of Arts and Sciences. At last 
year's fall meeting of the American 
Chemical Society, there was a special 
symposium honoring the 25th anniver­
sary of the publication of his book, 
Transport Phenomena. 

1948 
Marcus Gordon Grodberg, M.S. 1948 
(biochemistry), is director of research 
at Colgate-Hoyt Laboratories in Nor­
wood, Massachusetts. In over 40 years 
of research and development in the 
pharmaceutical industry, he has con­
centrated mostly on the evaluation of 
fluorides in diseases of teeth and bones. 

Gunther S. Stent, Ph.D. 1948 (physical 
chemistry), is professor and chairman 
of molecular biology and director of 
the virus laboratory at the University 
of California, Berkeley. Professor 
Stent returned to Illinois this year for 
the first time since he graduated to give 
the keynote speech at the University of 
lllinois Allerton Faculty Conference in 
February. 

1949 
Ralph M. Robinson, B.S. 1949 
(chemical engineering), has been nam­
ed a fellow of the American Institute of 
Chemical Engineers, for achievements 
in the design and development of high 
pressure processes leading to efficient 
production of specialty chemicals such 
as nicotinic acid. Robinson is opera­
tions manager of pharmaceutical 
manufacturing wi th Abbott Laborator­
ies, North Chicago, lllinois. 

1950 
Robert L. Bohon, Ph.D. 1950 (physical 
chemistry), has been appointed direc­
tor of the Analytical and Properties 
Research Laboratory, Central Research 
Laboratories, at 3M in St. Paul, Min­
nesota. 

1953 
James W. Berry, Ph.D. 1953 {organic 
chemistry), is professor and depart­
ment head of nutrition and food 
science at the University of Arizona, 
Tucson, Arizona. 

Merland W. Grieb, Ph.D. 1953 
(analytical chemistry), has retired from 
the University of Idaho and is living in 
Seattle. 

1954 
I 

L. Bryce Andersen, Ph.D. 1954 
(chemical engineering), is dean of the 
College of Engineering at Southeastern 
Massachusetts University, North Dart­
mouth, Massachusetts. He was recent­
ly selected a fellow by the American In­
stitute of Chemical Engineers for his 
contributions to chemical engineering 
education as a teacher, administrator 
and author . Dr. Anderson has 
authored more than 20 technical 
publications including two widely used 
texts, Principles of Unit Operations 
and Introduction to Chemical 
Engineering. 

1956 
James S. Kaltenbronn, B.S. 1956 
(chemistry), (Ph.D. 1960, M.l.T. ), 
received an award last year for ex­
cellence in industrial chemical research 
from the Huron Valley Section of the 
American Chemical Society. Kallen­
bronn's past work includes the syn­
thesis of Meclomen, Parke-Davis' 
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leading nonsteroidal drug. He has 
made significant contributions to the 
antiinfective and antihypertensive pro­
grams at Warner-Lambert/Parke­
Davis Pharmaceutical Research in Ann 
Arbor, Michigan. 

Edward G. Perkins, B.S. 1956 (chem­
istry), (Ph.D. 1958 in food science, Il­
linois), was honored with the 1986 
Alton E. Bailey Award , from the 
American Oil Chemists' Society, in 
February. The award is given each year 
by the North Central Section of AOCS 
to recognize outstanding research and 
exceptional service in the fats and oils 
industry. Perkins is a professor of food 
chemistry and nutritional sciences at 
the University of l1linois, Urbana. 

1958 
Roberto Lee, B.S. 1958 (chemical 
engineering), is engineering group con­
sultant for the Monsanto Company in 
St. Louis, Missouri. He was recently 
elected a director of the American In­
stitute of Chemical Engineers to serve a 
three-year term on the society's gover­
ning council. Lee specializes in process 
design and reaction engineering . 

1962 
George A. Samara, Ph.D. 1962 (chemi­
cal engineering), has been elected to the 
National Academy of Engineering. 
Samara, who is manager of the con­
densed matter and device physics 
department of the Sandia National 
Laboratories in Albuquerq ue, New 
Mexico, was cited for contributions to 
the understanding of dielectric, fer­
roelectric, and ferromagnetic materials 
applications. 

1963 
Carl W. Vermeulen, M.S. 1963 (bio­
chemistry) (Ph.D. 1966, microbiology, 
Atwood), teaches microbiology at the 
College of William and Mary, Wil­
Hamsburg, Virginia. His research con­
cerns the rationale of the E. coli 
chromosome. Vermeulen recently 
received a prize from the college for in­
volving so many undergraduates in 
research. 



Thomas M. Warne, M.S. 1963 
(organic chemistry) (Ph.D. 1970, 
Northwestern,) was recently named as­
sociate editor for Lubrication Engineer­
ing, and Transactions of tlte American 
Society of Lubrication Engineering. 
Warne is senior research scientist at the 
Amoco Oil Company, Research and 
Development, in Naperville, Illinois. 

1970 
James W. Pickett, M.S. 1970 (analy­
tical chemistry), has been the chief 
chemist for Olin Corporation's Win­
chester Ammunition Group, East 
Alton, Illinois, for four years. His lab 
supports ammunition manufacturing, 
non-ferrous metal casting and rolling 
and environmental engineering. 

1971 
John l. Anderson, Ph.D. 1971 (chemi­
cal engineering), is professor and head 
of the Department of Chemical Engin­
eering at Carnegie-Mellon University, 
Pittsburgh, Pennsylvania. 
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1972 
Frank l. Slejko, Ph.D. 1972 (chemis­
try), publishes a trade journal for the 
high-tech industries on "obtaining the 
ultimate in water purity." His com­
pany, Tall Oaks Publishing, is based in 
Voorhees, New Jersey. 

Marty Aschauer, B.S. 1972 (chemical 
engineering) (Ph.D. environmental 
engineering at lllinois). recently 
became director of research and 
development and quality assurance at 
the Hardy Salt Division of the Dia­
mond Crystal Salt Company, 
Manistee, Michigan. Aschauer joined 
the Hardy Salt Company in 1976 as a 
project engineer. 

1973 
Beth lepinski, M.S. 1973 (biochem­
istry), is group leader in applied 
research on paper coatings at Appleton 
Papers, Inc., Appleton, Wisconsin. 
She coordinates research projects 
related to synthetic and paper 
substrates predominantly in the con­
verter and graphic arts products areas. 
Lepinski joined the company in 1976 as 
a senior chemist. 

KEEP IN TOUCH 

1978 
Glenn H. lewis, B.S. 1978 (organ­
ic/analytical chemistry), was recently 
promoted to leader of the advanced 
physical technology group in the 
Research and Development Division of 
Helene Curtis, Inc., in Chicago. 

1980 
Robert J. McMahon, B.S. 1980 (chemi­
stry), received his Ph.D. in organic 
chemistry from the University of 
California, los Angeles. During his 
career at UCLA, McMahon held NSF 
and IBM Graduate Fellowships, and 
was named a UCLA Distinguished 
Scholar. McMahon has accepted a 
postdoctoral position with Professor 
M.S. Wrighton at MJ.T. 

1982 
Michael Bova, B.S. 1982 (chemistry), 
was the 1985 recipient of the 
Blackledge award at Southern lllinois 
University School of Medicine. The 
grant was established to encourage 
students to return to practice medicine 
in Southern Illinois. 
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Laying the cornerstone for the East Chemistry Building, 1946 
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